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Millions of personal computers and television sets are thrown out each year, leading to millions of pounds of toxic
waste. The amount will increase staggeringly in degree and velocity when the periodic take-up of new TV
technology occurs across the globe over the next few years. This accumulation of electronic hardware throughout
the world has caused grave environmental and health concerns that stem from the chemical and material
composition of these commodities, and their potential seepage into landfills, water sources, and, of course, the
bodies of workers. Much of this hardware wends its way back to where it was made, in Guiyu, China. This time,
pre-teen Chinese girls pick away–without protection–at the discarded technology full of leaded glass in order to
find precious metals, then dump the remains in landfills. They retain precious metals for sale to recyclers, who do
not use landfills or labor in the First World because of environmental and industrial legislation contra the poisonous
chemicals and gases in these machines (although Federal prisoners often undertake the same, dangerous recycling
as the girls of Guiyu.

The relevant multinational manufacturers of these goods have largely resisted assuming any responsibility for the
post-consumption histories of their dangerous products. The few recycling programs they sponsor in the US, for
example, rely on customers paying them to take away these poisonous goods. The Environmental Protection
Agency is largely silent on the topic, and Washington has used the World Trade Organization to counter efforts at
diminishing pollution from this equipment. The 1989 Convention on the Control of Transboundary Movement of
Hazardous Wastes and Their Disposal (the Basel Convention) gives a framework for understanding structural
obsolescence as a problem of post-industrial economics and cultures, but is not applied adequately. Thankfully, a
combination of European market power and the European Union’s Restriction of Hazardous Substances legislation,
plus other mandates already in place, means that certain US firms specializing in hazardous computer parts adhere
to relevant safety standards. On this score, Sony’s PlayStation consoles are illegal in some countries (not the US)
because of the deadly levels of cadmium contained in their cables.

But are these topics addressed by most of us who celebrate the new possibilities of cross-media? Hardly at all. It’s
time we fixed that. Right now.

Summary

In this chapter we offered some commentary and critique to help critically consider cross-media communications.
In terms of commentary, we first assessed the current state of cross-media in our lives today and then looked
ahead to where we might like to see it evolving in the future. In terms of critique, we covered some of the
problems and promises of cross-media to help us determine what cross-media should be. Looking critically at
cross-media communications is the best way for us to ensure that we design and develop experiences that we
want to integrate into our lives.

Questions

by Alice Robison

- Do you agree with the authors when they write that what we are experiencing in today’s media climate “gives us
the promise of more integrated and engaging cross-media communications?” Or do you think that this maybe
cross-media communications are a fad? Will this all just burn out?

- What is the difference, if any, between transmedia and “cross-media communications?”

- What do you think is important for building brand loyalty? What is important for building fan cultures?

- This chapter identifies several potential areas for concern with regard to cross-media communications. At the top
of the list are privacy and ownership. Though considered separately here, how are they related to one another?
Which is more important, do you think?

- What are some important concerns that we often ignore when we celebrate the potential of cross-media
communications? Why do you think we tend to ignore them?

- What do you think is the biggest problem with cross-media communications as they are currently?

Chapter 12

Transparency & Ubiquity

Chapter Learning Objectives

Understand why and how cross-media should be transparent

Discover the importance of quality content

Understand the benefits of on-demand content

Learn how recommendations and tags can help us get more meaning out 
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